City of Euless
Bid Tabulation
Q-002-15 Miscellaneous Fire Equipment

Casco Industries MES Fire
Item Description Quantity Unit Price  Extension Unit Price  Extension
1. Boat Trailer for a Zodiac F420 1 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:
2. Titan Series Basket Stretcher 1 $610 $610 367.50  367.50
CMC # 726210 CMC 726100 As Spec
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:
Oceanid RDC 1 No Bid No Bid
NRS # 86114.01
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:
Carlson Boards 2 400.00 _ 800.00 429.95 859.90
NRS # 86113.02 As Spec As Spec
Manufacturer:




Casco Industries

Item Description Quantity  Unit Price  Extension
US Divers Rescue Fins 2 65.00 130.00
CMC # 474150 As Spec
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:
Big Blower Red NRS# 80105.01 1 245.00  245.00
Manufacturer: As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

RQ3 Hose inflation kit,grey box NRS 45216.01 1 393.00 393.00

Manufacturer: As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

8. Pelican Lights Nemo 43008C Graniger 4300000245 4 47.00 _188.00
Manufacturer: Pelican
Model No; 4300-017-244
Delivery:

9. Agqua-Pac Radio Holder NRS 55319.02 4 25.00 100.00
Manufacturer: As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

10. Throw Bags with Snag Plate NRS 45306.01 2 19.00  38.00
Manufacturer: As Spec

MES Fire
Unit Price  Extension

80.00 160.00

As Spec

299.95 299.95
As Spec

422.35 422.35
As Spec

No Bid

32.00 128.00
As Spec

24.95
As Spec

49.90



Iltem Description

Quantity

Casco Industries
Unit Price  Extension

MES Fire
Unit Price  Extension

11. Crosslines red bag 70’ NRS 45103.01
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

12. LSP Cinch Collar (Yellow) CMC 721593
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

13. Trunk Cache Bag CMC 440541
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

14, High Lines Carriage CMC 300391
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

RESCUE RIVER Z-Rig Kit

15. Yellow Rope Bag #2 CMC 430207
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

4

39.00  156.00
As Spec

319.00  319.00
As spec

192.00 192.00
As spec

194.00  194.00
As spec

48.00 48.00
As Spec

51.00 204.00
As Spec

335.00 335.00
As Spec

247.00 247.00
As Spec

249.00 249.00
As Spec

62.00 62.00
As Spec



Casco Industries

MES Fire

Item Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
16. 7/16 Yellow/Blue Lifeline 150" River 106.00 106.00 148.50 148.50
Rescue Line CMC 300161 150 ft. CMC 293220 CMC 293220
17. Protech Screw- lock Brite carabiner
CMC 300161 11 16.00  176.00 21.00 231.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
18. Anchor plate Aluminum CMC 300610 1 45.00  45.00 58.00 58.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
19. Rappel 8 CMC 300845 1 44.00 44.00 57.00 57.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
20. Rescue Runner, L CMC 201004 1 13.60 13.60 1750 17.50
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec

Model No;
Delivery:




Casco Industries MES Flire
Item Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
21. Protech Orange Screw-lock carabiner
CMC 300169 2 16.40  32.80 21.00 42.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
22, Protech Pulley Single CMC 300501 3 41.00 123.00 53.00 159.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
23, OS Systems survival Dry Suit, Med
CMC 475903 1 950.00 _ 950.00 1,095.00 1,095.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
24. OS Systems survival Dry Suit, L
CMC 475904 3 950.00 _ 2,850.00 1,095.00  3,285.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
25. OS Systems survival Dry Suit, XL 3 950.00 _ 2,850.00 1,095.00 3,285.00

CMC 475905
Manufacturer:
Model No;

As Spec

As Spec



Casco Industries

MES Fire

Item Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
26. OS Systems survival Dry Suit, XXL
CMC 475906 3 950.00  2,850.00 1,095.00 3,285.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
217, Duffel Quick Change Mesh bag 3 45.00 135.00 60.00 180.00
NRS 55004.001 As Spec As Spec
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:
28. Rescue wetsuit Full Front Zip
NRS 17276.01 3 199.50 598.00 262.00 786.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:
29. PFD Extrasport Ranger NRS 40120.01 3 164.00  492.00 220.00 660.00

Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

As Spec

As Spec



Casco Industries

MES Fire

Item Description Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

30. Havoc Livery Helmet NRS42604.01 3 26.00 78.00 34.00 102.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

31 ACR Firefly Plus Strobe NRS 71714.01 10 33.00 _330.00 42.50 425.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

32. Fox 40 whistle NRS 45301.01 3 4.50 13.50 7.45 22.35
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

33. Paddler Gloves NRS 25025.02 3 24.00  72.00 31.00 93.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

34. Wet Socks NRS 30012.01 3 16.00 _48.00 20.00 60.00
Manufacturer: As Spec As Spec
Model No;
Delivery:

35, New Balance Moyea BootsNRS 31000.02 3 No Bid 77.00  231.00
Manufacturer: See Bid




Item

Description Quantity

Casco Industries
Unit Price  Extension

MES Fire
Unit Price  Extension

36.

37.

38

39.

40.

41.

Princeton Tec Apex LED Headlamp

NRS 71644.02 10
Manufacturer:

Model No;

Delivery:

Pilot Knife NRS 47300.01 3
Manufacturer:

Model No;

Delivery:

4 Stroke True Fuel Home Depot# 6527238 1
Manufacturer:

Model No;

Delivery:

Chain Saw Stihl# MS-291 1
Manufacturer:

Model No;

Delivery:

Bag for Cab Home Depot# STST70574 1
Manufacturer:

Model No;

Delivery:

Smoke Detector Bag Home Depot# 82004N11 1

63.00 630.00
As Spec

29.00  87.00
As Spec

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

75.00 750.00
As Spec

33.00 99.00
As Spec

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Casco Industries MES Fire
Iltem Description Quantity Unit Price  Extension Unit Price  Extension

42. Gear Keeper Cop Quest# 49-2266-0000 2 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

43. Rain Coat Grainger# 5AD49 4 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery:

44, Mesh Bag For Raincoat Outdoorpros#
143P 12 x18 4 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:
Model No;
Delivery: Delivery 4-6 weeks 30 days




